
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 



 

 

 

 

For the best results put “Sticker design:” before 
each prompt 

 
1. Scarry Fantasy Halloween Sticker, High Quality, 

Detailed, No Background, 4k resolution, neon 
color 

2. Fantasy Cartoon Halloween Sticker, High 
Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

3. (Haunted House), (Gothic), Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

4. (Black Cat), (Minimalist), Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

5. (Zombie Hands), (Horror), Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

6. (Witch's Cauldron), (Whimsical), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

7. (Pumpkin), (Watercolor), Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 



 

 

 
 

8. (Vampire), (Cartoon), Halloween Sticker, High 
Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

9. (Ghost), (Abstract), Halloween Sticker, High 
Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

10. (Spider), (Realistic), Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

11. (Skeleton), (Vintage), Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

12. (Candy Corn), (Pop Art), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

13. (Witch's Hat), (Surreal), Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

14. (Haunted Forest), (Fantasy), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

15. (Creepy Clown), (Impressionist), 
Halloween Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No 
Background, 4k resolution, neon color 



 

 

 
 

16. (Cemetery), (Monochrome), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

17. (Frankenstein), (Pixel Art), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

18. (Cauldron), (Pointillism), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

19. (Bats), (Geometric), Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

20. (Werewolf), (Expressionist), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

21. (Mummy), (Monochromatic), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

22. (Alien Invasion), (Sci-Fi), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

23. (Candy Monsters), (Abstract), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 



4k resolution, neon color 
31. Candy Land, Whimsical, Halloween 

Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

 

 

 
 

24. (Wicked Witch), (Comic Book), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

25. (Grim Reaper), (Dark), Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

26. (Voodoo Doll), (Mixed Media), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

27. (Moonlit Wolves), (Dreamy), Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

28. Pumpkin Patch, Watercolor, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

29. Wicked Wizard, Minimalist, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

30. Zombie Outbreak, Horror, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 



resolution, neon color 
39. Haunted Dollhouse, Impressionist, 

Halloween Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No 
Background, 4k resolution, neon color 

 

 

 
 

32. Spooky Mansion, Cartoon, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

33. Enchanted Forest, Abstract, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

34. Creepy Crawlies, Realistic, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

35. Wandering Spirits, Vintage, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

36. Haunted Carnival, Pop Art, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

37. Witch's Brew, Surreal, Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

38. Candy Galaxy, Fantasy, Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 



 

 

 
 

40. Ghostly Apparitions, Monochrome, 
Halloween Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No 
Background, 4k resolution, neon color 

41. Mechanical Monstrosity, Pixel Art, 
Halloween Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No 
Background, 4k resolution, neon color 

42. Wicked Webs, Pointillism, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

43. Haunted Castle, Geometric, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, , No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

44. Midnight Howlers, Expressionist, 
Halloween Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No 
Background, 4k resolution, neon color 

45. Ancient Pharaoh, Monochromatic, 
Halloween Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No 
Background, 4k resolution, neon color 

46. Alien Abduction, Sci-Fi, Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

47. Candy Dreams, Abstract, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 



 

 

 
 

48. Wicked Warlock, Dark, Halloween Sticker, 
High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 4k 
resolution, neon color 

49. Cyber Haunt, Comic Book, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

50. Eerie Experiment, Mixed Media, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

51. Moonlit Serenade, Dreamy, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

52. Galactic Ghouls, Cosmic, Halloween 
Sticker, High Quality, Detailed, No Background, 
4k resolution, neon color 

53. (Shadowy Specter), Eerie Halloween 
sticker, monochrome silhouette effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, misty graveyard 
background, 8k 

54. (Cursed Doll), Creepy Halloween sticker, 
porcelain doll effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, dimly lit attic background, 
8k 

55. (Witch's Lair), Spine-chilling Halloween 
sticker, dark fantasy painting effect, digital 



 

 

 
 

painting, contour, vector, foreboding cave 
background, 8k 

56. (Zombie Apocalypse), Apocalyptic 
Halloween sticker, post-apocalyptic effect, 
digital painting, contour, vector, desolate 
cityscape background, 8k 

57. (Candlelit Séance), Occult Halloween 
sticker, candlelit ritual effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, mystic pentagram 
background, 8k 

58. (Haunted Dollhouse), Sinister Halloween 
sticker, miniaturized horror effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, cursed mansion 
background, 8k 

59. (Wraith's Whispers), Ghostly Halloween 
sticker, ethereal mist effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, moonlit forest background, 8k 

60. (Cursed Shipwreck), Maritime Halloween 
sticker, ghost ship effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, stormy seas background, 8k 

61. (Witch's Grimoire), Occult Halloween 
sticker, ancient spellbook effect, detailed 
contour, vector, candlelit library background, 
8k 

62. (Cemetery Shadows), Dark Fantasy 
Halloween sticker, chilling silhouette effect, 



 

 

 
 

digital painting, contour, vector, moonlit 
tombstones background, 8k 

63. (Ghoul Gang), Spooky Halloween sticker, 
eerie portrait effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, foggy alleyway background, 
8k 

64. (Haunted Mirror), Supernatural Halloween 
sticker, mirror reflection effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, haunted mansion 
background, 8k 

65. (Cursed Woods), Sinister Halloween 
sticker, haunted forest effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, twisted trees background, 
8k 

66. (Witch's Coven), Occult Halloween sticker, 
coven gathering effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, moonlit clearing 
background, 8k 

67. (Spectral Eyes), Haunting Halloween 
sticker, disembodied eyes effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, misty attic 
background, 8k 

68. (Cryptic Symbols), Occult Halloween 
sticker, arcane symbol effect, digital painting, 



 

 

 
 

contour, vector, ancient temple background, 
8k 

69. (Cursed Portrait), Spooky Halloween 
sticker, haunted painting effect, digital 
painting, silhouette, vector, cobweb-covered 
mansion background, 8k 

70. (Witch's Crystal Ball), Mystic Halloween 
sticker, crystal ball effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, swirling mist background, 8k 

71. (Skeletal Legion), Macabre Halloween 
sticker, skeleton army effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, moonlit battlefield 
background, 8k 

72. (Cursed Mask), Dark Fantasy Halloween 
sticker, cursed artifact effect, detailed contour, 
vector, ominous ritual background, 8k 

73. (Haunted Asylum), Spooky Halloween 
sticker, asylum corridor effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, flickering light background, 
8k 

74. (Candlelit Crypt), Eerie Halloween sticker, 
crypt scene effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, ancient tomb background, 8k 

75. (Witch's Potions), Occult Halloween 
sticker, potion bottles effect, digital painting, 



 

 

 
 

silhouette, vector, alchemical laboratory 
background, 8k 

76. (Spectral Fog), Haunting Halloween 
sticker, eerie fog effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, moonlit swamp background, 
8k 

77. (Cursed Amulet), Supernatural Halloween 
sticker, cursed artifact effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, ethereal energy background, 
8k 

78. (Ghastly Gourds), Whimsical Halloween 
sticker, chalkboard art effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, chalky background, 8k 

79. (Candy Reaper), Playful Halloween 
sticker, candy-themed effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, rainbow background, 8k 

80. (Witch's Familiar), Enchanting Halloween 
sticker, mystical watercolor effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, enchanted forest 
background, 8k 

81. (Vampire's Elegance), Gothic Halloween 
sticker, monochromatic portrait effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, lace pattern 
background, 8k 



 

 

 
 

82. (Moonlit Magic), Serene Halloween sticker, 
ink wash effect, digital painting, silhouette, 
vector, moonlit lake background, 8k 

83. (Pumpkin Parade), Quirky Halloween 
sticker, patchwork quilt effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, whimsical background, 8k 

84. (Haunted Carousel), Vintage Halloween 
sticker, sepia tone effect, detailed contour, 
vector, antique carnival background, 8k 

85. (Cursed Rose), Dark Romance Halloween 
sticker, oil painting effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, thorny vine background, 8k 

86. (Zombie Ballerina), Macabre Halloween 
sticker, fractured glass effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, shattered mirror 
background, 8k 

87. (Candy Galaxy), Cosmic Halloween sticker, 
surreal space effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, nebula background, 8k 

88. (Wicked Whispers), Typography 
Halloween sticker, eerie calligraphy effect, 
vector, misty graveyard background, 8k 

89. (Pumpkin Guardians), Fantasy Halloween 
sticker, ancient stone carving effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, enchanted ruins 
background, 8k 



 

 

 
 

90. (Ghostly Harbor), Nautical Halloween 
sticker, maritime painting effect, digital 
painting, silhouette, vector, misty harbor 
background, 8k 

91. (Candy Alchemy), Whimsical Halloween 
sticker, candy laboratory effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, bubbling cauldron 
background, 8k 

92. (Witch's Garden), Enchanted Halloween 
sticker, overgrown watercolor effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, magical garden 
background, 8k 

93. (Robot Trick-or-Treaters), Sci-fi Halloween 
sticker, robotic caricature effect, digital 
painting, silhouette, vector, futuristic city 
background, 8k 

94. (Vampire's Masquerade), Elegant 
Halloween sticker, masquerade ball effect, 
digital painting, contour, vector, opulent 
ballroom background, 8k 

95. (Cursed Relics), Archaeological Halloween 
sticker, weathered artifact effect, detailed 
contour, vector, ancient tomb background, 8k 



 

 

 
 

96. (Witchy Wonders), Mystical Halloween 
sticker, crystal ball effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, starlit night background, 8k 

97. (Goblin Market), Fantasy Halloween 
sticker, bustling marketplace effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, lantern-lit 
background, 8k 

98. (Candy Invasion), Playful Halloween 
sticker, candy aliens effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, colorful galaxy background, 
8k 

99. (Haunted Clocktower), Steampunk 
Halloween sticker, mechanical illustration 
effect, digital painting, silhouette, vector, 
gears and steam background, 8k 

100. (Witch's Potion Cabinet), Enchanted 
Halloween sticker, whimsical illustration 
effect, digital painting, contour, vector, 
enchanted cottage background, 8k 

101. (Cursed Carnival), Sinister Halloween 
sticker, carnival mirror effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, twisted funfair background, 
8k 

102. (Space Witch), Cosmic Halloween sticker, 
celestial watercolor effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, galaxy background, 8k 



 

 

 
 

103. (Zombie Hands), Spooky Halloween 
sticker, grunge effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, black background, 8k 

104. (Witch's Cauldron), Whimsical Halloween 
sticker, pastel watercolor effect, digital 
painting, silhouette, vector, purple 
background, 8k 

105. (Creepy Eyes), Eerie Halloween sticker, oil 
painting effect, abstract, vector, dark 
background, 8k 

106. (Pumpkin Patch), Playful Halloween 
sticker, cartoon effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, orange background, 8k 

107. (Wicked Hat), Mysterious Halloween 
sticker, charcoal sketch effect, detailed 
contour, vector, foggy background, 8k 

108. (Haunted Forest), Enchanting Halloween 
sticker, fantasy watercolor effect, digital 
painting, silhouette, vector, moonlit 
background, 8k 

109. (Candy Explosion), Colorful Halloween 
sticker, splatter paint effect, abstract, vector, 
vibrant background, 8k 



 

 

 
 

110. (Mystic Tarot), Magical Halloween sticker, 
tarot card illustration, vector, mystical 
background, 8k 

111. (Sugar Skull), Dia de los Muertos-inspired 
Halloween sticker, intricate pattern effect, 
digital painting, contour, vector, black 
background, 8k 

112. (Alien Invaders), Sci-fi Halloween sticker, 
neon glow effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, space background, 8k 

113. (Vampire's Bite), Seductive Halloween 
sticker, vintage poster effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, red background, 8k 

114. (Cursed Treasure), Adventure-themed 
Halloween sticker, rough ink effect, detailed 
contour, vector, aged paper background, 8k 

115. (Wicked Laughter), Typography 
Halloween sticker, hand-lettered effect, vector, 
eerie mist background, 8k 

116. (Moonlit Wolves), Mystic Halloween 
sticker, dreamy watercolor effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, night sky 
background, 8k 

117. (Candy Castle), Fantasy Halloween sticker, 
candyland illustration effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, sugary background, 8k 



 

 

 
 

118. (Robot Pumpkin), Futuristic Halloween 
sticker, metallic texture effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, technological background, 8k 

119. (Spooky Tea Party), Whimsical Halloween 
sticker, mixed media effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, whimsical background, 8k 

120. (Glowing Jack-o'-Lanterns), Magical 
Halloween sticker, luminescent effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, starry night 
background, 8k 

121. (Cauldron Concoctions), Potion-making 
Halloween sticker, vintage botanical 
illustration effect, detailed contour, vector, 
parchment background, 8k 

122. (Zombie Disco), Retro Halloween sticker, 
disco ball effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, groovy background, 8k 

123. (Cursed Mirror), Dark Fantasy Halloween 
sticker, shattered glass effect, digital painting, 
silhouette, vector, haunting background, 8k 

124. (Witch's Book of Spells), Mystical 
Halloween sticker, illuminated manuscript 
effect, digital painting, contour, vector, ancient 
tome background, 8k 



 

 

 
 

125. (Candy Constellations), Galactic Halloween 
sticker, cosmic watercolor effect, digital 
painting, contour, vector, celestial 
background, 8k 

126. (Goblin Gang), Cartoon Halloween sticker, 
comic book effect, digital painting, silhouette, 
vector, action-packed background, 8k 

127. (Frankenstein's Lab), Classic Monster 
Halloween sticker, vintage laboratory 
illustration effect, detailed contour, vector, 
electrifying background, 8k 

128. (Witch), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

129. (Ghost), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

130. (Pumpkin), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

131. (Vampire), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

132. (Black Cat), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 



 

 

 
 

133. (Zombie), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

134. (Frankenstein), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

135. (Mummy), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

136. (Werewolf), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

137. (Candy Corn), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

138. (Haunted House), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

139. (Bats), Cute Halloween sticker, watercolor 
effect, digital painting, contour, vector, white 
background, 8k 

140. (Spider), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 



 

 

 
 

141. (Cauldron), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

142. (Skeleton), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

143. (Cemetery), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

144. (Witch's Hat), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

145. (Trick-or-Treaters), Cute Halloween 
sticker, watercolor effect, digital painting, 
contour, vector, white background, 8k 

146. (Candy Apples), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

147. (Grim Reaper), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

148. (Owl), Cute Halloween sticker, watercolor 
effect, digital painting, contour, vector, white 
background, 8k 



 

 

 
 

149. (Witch's Broom), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

150. (Jack-o'-Lantern), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

151. (Scarecrow), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 

152. (Candy Monsters), Cute Halloween sticker, 
watercolor effect, digital painting, contour, 
vector, white background, 8k 


